
Unraveling the Mysteries of the Mosin Nagant
1891/30 Rifle Models 38 and 91

The Legendary Firearm: A Brief

The Mosin Nagant 1891/30 rifle models 38 and 91 have firmly established
themselves as iconic weapons in the realm of firearms. With a storied history
dating back over a century, these rifles have seen action on numerous battlefields
across the globe. In this article, we dive into the details of this legendary firearm,
exploring its disassembly and reassembly processes.

Unveiling the Mechanics: Understanding the Components

Prior to delving into the disassembly procedure, it is imperative to have a
comprehensive understanding of the various components that make up the Mosin
Nagant 1891/30 rifles.
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1. Stock:

The stock, commonly made of wood, serves as the main body of the rifle. It
provides stability and support for the other components.

2. Barrel:

The long, cylindrical barrel is responsible for guiding the bullet's trajectory. It
features rifling that imparts a spin on the bullet for increased accuracy.

3. Receiver:

As the heart of the rifle, the receiver houses and aligns various internal parts,
including the trigger mechanism, bolt, and magazine.

4. Bolt Assembly:

The bolt assembly serves as the action of the rifle, allowing for loading,
extracting, and ejecting of cartridges.

5. Magazine:
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The magazine, typically detachable, holds the cartridges before they are
chambered into the barrel.

Step-by-Step Disassembly

Now that we have a clear understanding of the rifle's components, let us proceed
with the disassembly process:

Step 1: Clear the Rifle

Prior to disassembling, always ensure that the rifle is unloaded. Remove the
magazine and any cartridges from the chamber.

Step 2: Remove the Bolt

To remove the bolt, pull it fully rearwards while simultaneously depressing the
trigger. Once the bolt is fully rearward, lift it upwards and remove it from the
receiver.

Step 3: Separate the Stock

Using a screwdriver or the appropriate tool, remove the screws securing the stock
to the receiver. Carefully lift the stock off the receiver, ensuring not to damage any
internal components.

Step 4: Dismantle the Receiver

With the stock removed, you can now separate the receiver from the barrel. This
may require tapping the barrel band and receiver with a soft mallet to loosen any
residual tension.

Step 5: Disassemble the Bolt



To disassemble the bolt assembly, retract the striker fully and turn the cocking
piece counterclockwise until it can be pulled free from the bolt body. Remove the
firing pin and spring.

Reassembling the Mosin Nagant 1891/30 Rifle

Now that we have accomplished the disassembly process, let us move on to the
reassembly:

Step 1: Assemble the Bolt

Begin by reinserting the firing pin and its spring into the bolt body. Then, place the
cocking piece over the firing pin and rotate it clockwise to secure it.

Step 2: Reattach the Receiver to the Barrel

Carefully align the receiver and barrel, ensuring the guiding pins and slots match.
Apply gentle pressure to firmly seat the receiver against the barrel. Reattach the
barrel band to secure the two components together.

Step 3: Reinstall the Stock

Position the stock over the receiver and barrel assembly, aligning the screw
holes. Reinsert and tighten the screws to securely attach the stock.

Step 4: Insert the Bolt

Align the bolt with the receiver, ensuring the extractor lines up with the
corresponding groove. Slide the bolt into the receiver until it locks in place.

Step 5: Final Check

Perform a final check to guarantee all components are securely assembled.
Verify the bolt's functionality and ensure it moves smoothly along the receiver.



The Mosin Nagant 1891/30 rifle models 38 and 91 possess a rich history and are
beloved by firearm enthusiasts worldwide. Understanding the disassembly and
reassembly processes not only deepens our knowledge of these iconic weapons
but also enhances our appreciation for their craftsmanship and design.

Disassembling and reassembling the Mosin Nagant 1891/30 rifle models 38 and
91 is a challenging yet rewarding task. Properly maintaining and caring for these
firearms will ensure their longevity for generations to come.
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in front of you. Detailed reassembly instructions, not just a statement to follow
same instructions in reverse. Written by Jamie Mangrum, author and publisher of
many, many military firearm disassembly and reassembly manuals. All new
detailed instructions that are not sold in printed format. Only available in Kindle
eBook format so you can carry with you anywhere including the shooting range or
garage work bench.
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