
The Human Right To Water And International
Economic Law Routledge Giappichelli:
Protecting the Essential Resource for All
Water, a fundamental element to sustain life, is unmistakably vital for every
individual and community. Access to clean, safe, and affordable water is
considered a basic human right by the United Nations. Despite this recognition,
many across the globe continue to face challenges in accessing this crucial
resource. The intersection of the human right to water and international economic
law is a matter that necessitates understanding and action to ensure the
realization of this fundamental right for every person.

The Human Right to Water

The human right to water emphasizes that every person should have access to
sufficient, safe, acceptable, and affordable water for personal and domestic use.
This right extends to drinking, hygiene, sanitation, and food production. The
realization of this right is crucial for individuals to lead a healthy and dignified life.
However, millions of people worldwide still lack access to clean water.

With the adoption of the United Nations General Assembly Resolution 64/292 in
2010, the human right to water was explicitly recognized and affirmed. This
resolution called upon all nations to ensure the availability and sustainable
management of water resources, while also enhancing sanitation services. It was
a significant step towards acknowledging the importance of water and its link to
human rights.
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International Economic Law and Water

International economic law comprises legal norms and principles that govern
economic relations between states. It covers various areas, including trade,
investment, and finance. In the context of water, international economic law plays
a crucial role as it impacts the availability and accessibility of this essential
resource in different countries.

Trade agreements, for instance, can influence the management and distribution
of water resources. Sometimes, these agreements prioritize economic interests
over the human right to water, leading to privatization of water services or
unequal access to water based on ability to pay. International economic law,
therefore, needs to strike a balance between promoting economic development
and safeguarding the human right to water.

Routledge Giappichelli: Addressing the Intersection

Routledge Giappichelli, a renowned publisher focusing on legal and social
sciences, has delved into the subject of the human right to water and international
economic law in their publication titled "The Human Right To Water And
International Economic Law." This book explores the complex relationship
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between the economic aspects of water management and the protection of the
right to water.

Authored by Dr. Flavia Zorzi Giustiniani, a legal expert specializing in human
rights, international law, and water governance, the book highlights the
challenges faced in realizing the human right to water within the framework of
international economic law. By analyzing relevant legal principles and cases, the
book offers an in-depth examination of the subject and proposes strategies for
achieving a balanced approach.

The Importance of the Book

"The Human Right To Water And International Economic Law" by Routledge
Giappichelli offers a comprehensive analysis of the intersection between the
human right to water and international economic law. As water scarcity becomes
an increasingly pressing global issue, understanding this complex relationship is
necessary to ensure sustainable and equitable water management practices.

The book addresses key questions, such as how trade and investment
agreements impact the right to water, and how these agreements can be
reformed to better align with human rights principles. It explores legal frameworks
and innovative approaches to protect the right to water while promoting economic
development.

The Way Forward

Ensuring access to clean water for all requires a multidimensional approach
involving governments, international organizations, civil society, and the private
sector. Recognizing the human right to water within the framework of international
economic law is essential to achieving this goal.



Policy-makers, legal practitioners, scholars, and water governance experts can
greatly benefit from the insights and analyses provided by "The Human Right To
Water And International Economic Law." By understanding the complexities and
challenges at the intersection of these two fields, stakeholders can work towards
creating policies and strategies that guarantee the human right to water without
compromising economic development.

, the human right to water and international economic law are intertwined in their
impact on water access and distribution. Routledge Giappichelli's publication
"The Human Right To Water And International Economic Law" sheds light on this
complex relationship, offering valuable insights and recommendations for
achieving a balance between economic interests and the human right to water. It
serves as a vital resource for anyone invested in securing this fundamental right
for all individuals and communities around the world.
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This book discusses the international right to water and the liberalization of water
services. It is concerned with the harmonization of the right to water with the legal
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systems under which liberalization of water services has taken or may take place.
It assesses paths of harmonization between international human rights law and
international economic law in this specific field.

The issue of the compatibility between the fulfilment of the right to water and the
liberalization of water services has been at the heart of a passionate public
debate between opponents and advocates of the privatization of the utility. The
book provides an unbiased analysis of different international legal regimes under
which the liberalization of water services has occurred or is likely to occur, notably
international investment law, international trade law and European Union law, in
order to assess whether the main features of the right to water can be guaranteed
under each of these systems of law and whether there is space for prospective
harmonization.

The work will be an invaluable resource for academics, researchers and policy-
makers working in the areas of International Human Rights Law, International
Economic Law, International Water Law, International Trade Law and EU Law.
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